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Message:
I would like to add a few quotes on the topic of voting
rights from the king family.

“I have come to see more and more that one of the most
decisive steps that the Negro can take is that little walk to
the voting booth. That is an important step. We've got to
gain the ballot, and through that gain, political power.”
 - Martin Luther King jr

"Like those who crossed the Edmund Pettus Bridge on
Bloody Sunday, we will not accept empty promises in
pursuit of my father's dream for a more equal and just
America,"
- Martin Luther King Ill

Me and many others like me are more than willing to fight
for our voting rights just as the people did during the
Selma march. The fact that this racist and unjust re
drawing of the maps is even something we are talking
about in 2025 is quite embarrassing for you all and for
Texas as a state. For a state that just recently passed a
law about having the 10 commandments in school you all
don’t seem to be too familiar with those commandments.
Literally the first 2 commandments talk about not having
any gods before god himself and no idols yet here we are
in midst of you all bowing down to trump like he’s your
god. YOU ALL ARE LITERAL HYPOCRITES. On top of that
just to speak on the hypocrisy of this whole situation I
have 3 brief breakdowns of just how hypocritical you all
are.

1. Saying race doesn't matter while drawing maps that
systematically disadvantage voters of color.



2. Benefiting from population growth driven by people of
color, then creating maps that ignore or diminish their
voting power.

3. Advocating for decentralization, then using centralized
redistricting to protect incumbents or party control.

But ya know what maybe you all do know the 10
commandments better than I thought. One of the
commandments states to honor thy father and mother 
and we all know you weirdo worshippers of trump/maga
do like the refer to him as “Daddy trump” so at least you
understand that one!




