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Message:
I would like to state plainly that every member
should be aware that there will be consequences for 
these illegal actions and your unjust attempt to
manipulate the voting process in order to avoid
being answerable to the majority. There is no other
explanation for your actions other than to maintain
power in the face of unpopular policies by
manipulating the voting process in order to not be
held accountable to the majority voice.
These actions are the actions of dictators,
autocrats, and authoritarians. By doing this you
have broken your oath of office and are defying the
constitution. There will be consequences for these
choices.

For far too long those of us with rational thoughts
have been avoiding the criticism of your childish
religious views, in order to not hurt your delicate
feelings. The absurdity of such a position is why we
are in the predicament we are in now. By avoiding
the criticism of your childish beliefs, that so
obviously mirror what would be considered adult
Santa Claus, you have become emboldened. You
have forced your ignorant beliefs on the rest of us,
and now you want to force your legislative and
political dominance on us as well.
You have now taken your mile and continue to try
and take more.
I personally have reached my limit of tolerance. Not
for one second longer will I be respectful or tolerant
of your absurd beliefs and will tell you to your faces
that you sound like dumb children. It never needed
to come to this, you could have kept your beliefs to
yourselves and in your churches. But due to the fact



that deep down you all know it’s utter nonsense and
the reality is you’re just scared of the world, nothing
will ever be enough for you. Because you’re never
addressing the real problem, which is simply your
fear.
So the time has come to be done with this
arrangement. You have no one to blame but
yourselves for your absurdity as well as your choice
to abuse power. Your very actions are the proof that
your entire belief system is made up, because you
don’t even follow the very tenets your beliefs are
derived from. You are hypocrites and cowards, and
worse than that, you have attacked, dehumanized
and disparaged your fellow human beings. Your
views and beliefs are now meaningless, hollow, and
pathetic. And we will do everything within our power
to dismantle your pathetic coup.
You have pushed for far too long, and you will now
be pushed back. And you will lose, just as your
Confederate and Nazi brethren did.




