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Affirm public info: I agree

Regarding: Congressional

Message:
As a citizen of Texas I feel a deep obligation to
stand up for myself, and my fellow Texans by
imploring this committee to NOT REDRAW
DISTRICT LINES!!! This is completely
unacceptable. Redrawing district lines would favor
one party and completely disregard the voters of
other parties. This committee is made up of
elected public servants of Texas who are
supposed to serve the interests of all Texans, and
a significant way to do that is by honoring the
votes of the public, whether you agree with the
outcome of those votes or not. Please, for the
fairness and justice of ALL Texans, do not further
divide our state by suppressing voters with
redistricting. Please. Please think of us. The
everyday Texan citizens. We are out here working
for the betterment of our state every single day.
We are your teachers, nurses, doctors, bakers,
cooks, drivers, construction workers, social
workers, librarians, etc. We do our part to serve
this state. We are asking you to remember your
promise to do your part as the people we elected
into power. Please think of us. Don’t forget us.
Vote for OUR best interest as an entire state.
Please do not redistrict. Thank you for your time.
Sincerely and with much hope in my heart that
you will do the right thing,
Isabella Gonzalez.




